BID TABULATION

Tires
April 11, 2013
ITEM Qry SIZE / DESCRIPTION
1. 95 11R22.5 Hwy, Load G
2. 10 12R22.5 Lug, Load H
3. 12 16.9-24
4, 4 20.5-25
5. 10 ST205/75D15
6. 4 15x 6.0-6
7. 4 26 x12.0-12
8. 2 13 x 5.00-6NHS
9. 2 22.95x 10
10. 2 26 x 9-12 PXT
11. 2 26 x 11-12 PXT
12. 2 ST225/75R15, Load D
13 10 215/70R15
14 10 8.75/16.5LT, Load 115/111R
15 10 P195/70R14
16. 10 P215/75R16
17. 375 P225/60R16, Load 97V
18. 50 P235/70R16
19. 10 P235/75R16
20. 200 245/55R18, Load 103
21. 50 P245/65R17
22. 12 P265/70R17
23. 10 255/55R18
24, 4 ST205/75R15, Load C
25. 4 ST235/80R16
26. 2 215/75R17.5, Load H
27. 12 215/60R16
28. 24 235/70R16
29. 4 295/80R22.5, Load H
30. 100 10R22.5 Hwy
31. 10 11R22.5 Lug
32. 10 12R22.5 Hwy
33. 10 225/70R 19.5, Load F
34. 10 225/75R15
35. 10 245/70R19.5, Load F
36. 40 255/70R22.5
37. 10 265/75R22.5
38. 10 275/80R22.5

40. 20 385/65R22.5 Hwy
41. 10 425/65R22.5
42. 20 LT225/75R16
43. 30 LT235/85R16

GCR TIRE CENTERS

MFG

Firestone
Firestone
Solideal
Solideal
Hi-Run
Carlisle
Carlisle
Carlisle
Carlisle
Carlisle
Carlisle
Hi-Run
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
BF Goodrich
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Hi-Run
Hi-Run
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Bridgestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Bridgestone
Continental
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone

UNIT PRICE

$301.11
$513.02
$549.00
$845.00
$59.90

$36.00

$159.00
$34.00

$99.75

$130.00
$139.00
$86.90

$86.27

$101.95
$69.06

$135.00
$92.31

$103.34
$105.82
$123.43
$167.30
$119.00
$191.19
$76.95

$128.50
$286.92
$81.55

$103.34
$524.46
$307.37
$345.96
$462.09
$243.64
$118.74
$308.09
$274.28
$464.79
$509.00
$484.79
$492.77
$549.43
$111.53
$114.80

AMOUNT

$28,605.45
$5,130.20
$6,588.00
$3,380.00
$599.00
$144.00
$636.00
$68.00
$199.50
$260.00
$278.00
$173.80
$862.70
$1,019.50
$690.60
$1,350.00
$34,616.25
$5,167.00
$1,058.20
$24,686.00
$8,365.00
$1,428.00
$1,911.90
$307.80
$514.00
$573.84
$978.60
$2,480.16
$2,097.84
$30,737.00
$3,459.60
$4,620.90
$2,436.40
$1,187.40
$3,080.90
$10,971.20
$4,647.90
$5,090.00
$24,239.50
$9,855.40
$5,494.30
$2,230.60
$3,444.00



44,
45.
46.
47.
48.
49.
50.
51.
52.
53.
54.
55.
56.
57.
58.
59.
60.
61.
62.
63.
64.
65.

Delivery:

40
10
20
10
10
40
30
20
20
100
40
20
10
20
10
10
10
20
10
20
10
10

LT245/75R16, HT, Load E
LT245/75R16
LT245/75R17, HT
LT245/75R17, AT, Load E
LT265/75R16
P205/75R15
P215/75R15
P225/70R15
P225/75R15
P235/55R17
P235/70R17
P235/75R15
P235/75R17
P245/70R17
12.5-80/18
19.5-24

211-24
LT215/85R16
P195/60R15
P245/75R16
ST205/75D14
ST2015/75R15

GRAND TOTAL:

Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Kumho
Kumho
Firestone
Kumho
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Solideal
Solideal
Solideal
Firestone
Firestone
Firestone
Hi-Run
Hi-Run

$110.11
$115.94
$123.66
$124.66
$126.24
$83.75
$89.90
$93.92
$94.90
$105.38
$101.92
$100.91
$110.74
$103.35
$275.00
$553.00
$655.00
$103.52
$67.36
$112.07
$61.00
$78.91

Next Day

$4,404.40
$1,159.40
$2,473.20
$1,246.60
$1,262.40
$3,350.00
$2,697.00
$1,878.40
$1,898.00
$10,538.00
$4,076.80
$2,018.20
$1,107.40
$2,067.00
$2,750.00
$5,530.00
$6,550.00
$2,070.40
$673.60
$2,241.40
$610.00
$789.10

$307,055.74



TREADQUARTERS

MFG UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Dunlop SP160 $326.98 $31,063.10
Goodyear 0661 $514.02 $5,140.20
B4 Sampson $413.18 $4,958.16
Samson $1,100.50 $4,402.00
Hi-Run $56.43 $564.30
Carlisle $37.18 $148.72
Carlisle $99.10 $396.40
Carlisle $25.60 $51.20
Carlisle $85.00 $170.00
Carlisle $99.00 $198.00
Carlisle $105.00 $210.00
Hi-Run $80.44 $160.88
Goodyear Integrity $65.65 $656.50
Firestone $152.00 $1,520.00
Goodyear Integrity $65.42 $654.20
Goodyear WrLST $111.37 $1,113.70
GY Eagle RSA $97.73 $36,648.75
GY Wrangler SRA $121.73 $6,086.50
GY Wrangler ST $115.71 $1,157.10
Goodyear $135.63 $27,126.00
GY Fortera $119.99 $5,999.50
SRA $142.07 $1,704.84
LS2 $132.57 $1,325.70
Hi-Run $69.64 $278.56
Hi-Run $107.24 $428.96
GYRHS I $466.13 $932.26
GY Fuel Max $93.31 $1,119.72
Goodyear Integrity $105.83 $2,539.92
GY 0670 RV $580.28 $2,321.12
Goodyear G661 $380.00 $38,000.00
Dunlop SP464 $412.96 $4,129.60
Dunlop SP348 $447.35 $4,473.50
Goodyear 0647 $295.00 $2,950.00
Goodyear WRL SRA $95.63 $956.30
Dunlop SP 348 $273.33 $2,733.30
Dunlop SP160 $304.09 $12,163.60
Goodyear G661 $406.75 $4,067.50
MichX202 $549.60 $5,496.00
Dunlop SP345 $549.44 $27,472.00
Dunlop SP231A $593.20 $11,864.00
Dunlop Sp281 $663.23 $6,632.30
Goodyear WRL SRA $133.53 $2,670.60
Goodyear WRL SRA $139.06 $4,171.80

COLONY TIRE

MFG UNIT PRICE
Cooper RM185 $275.00
Michelin XDS $622.04
BKT $515.00
Solideal $800.00
Full Run $55.00
Dee Stone $19.50
Cordovan $85.00
Dee Stone $17.50
Carlisle $91.00
Cordovan $88.50
ITP $129.00
Autogrip $90.00
Mastercraft $75.50
Dee Stone $109.95
Mastercraft $61.95
BF Goodrich $112.62
Mastercraft $105.00
Mastercraft $124.95
Mastercraft $124.95
Goodyear $225.00
BF Goodrich $132.11
Goodyear $147.00
Goodyear $155.00
Autogrip $79.05
Autogrip $99.95
Cooper RM160 $170.00
Mastercraft $74.95
Mastercraft $125.00
Michelin $639.67
Cooper $285.00
Cooper $300.00
BF Goodrich $450.96
Cooper $200.00
Toyo $88.95
Cooper $215.00
Cooper $239.00
Toyo $346.00
BF Goodrich $327.13
Cooper $385.00
Cooper $450.00
Cooper $530.00
Mastercraft $149.00
Mastercraft $150.00

AMOUNT

$26,125.00
$6,220.40
$6,180.00
$3,200.00
$550.00
$78.00
$340.00
$35.00
$182.00
$177.00
$258.00
$180.00
$755.00
$1,099.50
$619.50
$1,126.20
$39,375.00
$6,247.50
$1,249.50
$45,000.00
$6,605.50
$1,764.00
$1,550.00
$316.20
$399.80
$340.00
$899.40
$3,000.00
$2,558.68
$28,500.00
$3,000.00
$4,509.60
$2,000.00
$889.50
$2,150.00
$9,560.00
$3,460.00
$3,271.30
$19,250.00
$9,000.00
$5,300.00
$2,980.00
$4,500.00



Goodyear WRL HT
Goodyear SRA
Goodyear SRA

Goodyear ?

Goodyear WRL SRA

Hancock Optimo

Goodyear WRL SRA

Goodyear WRL SRA

Goodyear WRL SRA

Goodyear Fuel Max
Goodyear SRA
GY WRL Radial

Goodyear WRL SRA

Goodyear WRL SRA

Lande
Lande
Samson
Goodyear WRL SRA
Eagle RSA
Goodyear Fuel Max
Hi-Run
Hi-Run

$138.53
$143.83
$162.41
$176.69
$157.01
$76.55
$93.05
$95.80
$95.63
$129.98
$138.16
$87.00
$124.35
$137.90
$258.18
$479.44
$614.59
$133.36
$63.60
$116.50
$53.68
$69.64

$5,541.20
$1,438.30
$3,248.20
$1,766.90
$1,570.10
$3,062.00
$2,791.50
$1,916.00
$1,912.60
$12,998.00
$5,526.40
$1,740.00
$1,243.50
$2,758.00
$2,581.80
$4,794.40
$6,145.90
$2,667.20
$636.00
$2,330.00
$536.80
$696.40

$334,757.99

Immediate for in stock. 24-48 hours all others.

Item No. 39 deleted from Bid - Wrong Size
Duplicated Bids: 18 and 28; 34 and 52

Mastercraft
Mastercraft
BF Goodrich
BF Goodrich
Mastercraft
Mastercraft
Mastercraft
Mastercraft
Toyo
Toyo
Mastercraft
Mastercraft
Toyo
Mastercraft
Dee Stone
Dee Stone
BKT
Mastercraft
Mastercraft
Mastercraft
Autogrip
Autogrip

$154.00
$125.95
$157.73
$157.73
$155.00
$76.50
$75.50
$105.00
$88.00
$125.00
$145.00
$75.00
$154.00
$147.00
$297.47
$651.49
$788.69
$145.00
$67.00
$125.00
$66.17
$74.00

2 Days

$6,160.00
$1,259.50
$3,154.60
$1,577.30
$1,550.00
$3,060.00
$2,265.00
$2,100.00
$1,760.00
$12,500.00
$5,800.00
$1,500.00
$1,540.00
$2,940.00
$2,974.70
$6,514.90
$7,886.90
$2,900.00
$670.00
$2,500.00
$661.70
$740.00

$326,816.18



ABC TRUCK & TIRE REPAIR, LTD.

MFG

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
BFG 10056
No Bid
Mich 58906
BFG 27133
BFG 58028
BFG 29909
BFG 22027
No Bid
BFG 32131
BFG 21567
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
BFG 39484
BFG 29909
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
BFG 41881
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
BFG 93449
BFG 21480

UNIT PRICE

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$80.01
No Bid
$72.29
$100.54
$82.42
$101.54
$90.38
No Bid
$117.94
$118.52
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$90.28
$101.54
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$84.89
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$120.47
$128.84

AMOUNT

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$800.10
No Bid
$722.90
$1,005.40
$30,907.50
$5,077.00
$903.80
No Bid
$5,897.00
$1,422.24
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$1,083.36
$2,436.96
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$848.90
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$2,409.40
$3,865.20



BFG 89589 $131.80 $5,272.00

BFG 89589 $131.80 $1,318.00
BFG 49713 $140.81 $2,816.20
BFG 10209 $166.90 $1,669.00
BFG 52075 $140.13 $1,401.30
UN 10183 $75.39 $3,015.60
BFG 32459 $82.74 $2,482.20
UN 67118 $96.61 $1,932.20
BFG 41881 $84.89 $1,697.80
BFG 63395 $107.25 $10,725.00
BFG 30718 $122.50 $4,900.00
BFG 04893 $99.03 $1,980.60
BFG 34949 $123.08 $1,230.80
BFG 31653 117.49 $2,349.80
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
BFG 42205 $122.01 $2,440.20
BFG 82309 $68.59 $685.90
BFG 14340 $102.50 $2,050.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

$105,346.36
(Inc.)

Same Day



