

Bid Tabulation
Select Fill, Class B Sand, and Screened Topsoil
IFB# 2014-00070-AT

April 15, 2014

| | | Holland Sand Pit LLC | | Gray & Sons Construction Inc. | | Aggregate Transportation Corp. | | Suffolk Materials LLC | | Jack Frost Enterprises | |
|----------------|------------------|----------------------|---------------------|-------------------------------|--------------------|--------------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------|--------------------|------------------------|--------------------|
| | | <u>Unit Price</u> | <u>Amount</u> | <u>Unit Price</u> | <u>Amount</u> | <u>Unit Price</u> | <u>Amount</u> | <u>Unit Price</u> | <u>Amount</u> | <u>Unit Price</u> | <u>Amount</u> |
| 5,000 CY | Select Fill Sand | \$10.88 | \$54,400.00 | \$12.00 | \$60,000.00 | \$12.49 | \$62,450.00 | \$11.90 | \$59,500.00 | no bid | \$0.00 |
| 2,500 CY | Class B Sand | \$12.48 | \$31,200.00 | \$13.75 | \$34,375.00 | \$16.85 | \$42,125.00 | no bid | \$0.00 | no bid | \$0.00 |
| 1,500 CY | Screened Topsoil | \$18.48 | \$27,720.00 | no bid | \$0.00 | \$19.50 | \$29,250.00 | \$20.40 | \$30,600.00 | \$38.00 | \$57,000.00 |
| TOTALS: | | | \$113,320.00 | | \$94,375.00 | | \$133,825.00 | | \$90,100.00 | | \$57,000.00 |

Bid Tabulation does not constitute an award.