

Cleaning Supplies
16016-AT
October 14, 2015

U/M	DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	Rutherford Supply		Pyramid School Products		Xpedx LLC		Hunter-Taylor Supply LLC		Southeastern Paper Group		Birsch Industries		Forms & Supply Inc.		B. W. Wilson Paper		Milchem		Gills LLC dba Gill Supply		Masterman's LLP		Impact Imaging			
			UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT
CS	Hands Free Antibacterial Soap 1200 ml, Translucent Apricot color Pro Link #GJ-FA120 or approved equal 2/case	155	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -	\$31.86	\$ 4,938.30	\$27.90	\$ 4,324.50	\$34.98	\$ 5,421.90	\$28.77	\$ 4,459.35	\$43.50	\$ 6,742.50	\$41.82	\$ 6,482.10	\$47.77	\$ 7,404.35	\$59.68	\$ 9,250.40	\$69.99	\$ 10,848.45		
									Stoko		Ecotab			Dial		GoJo					GoJo		GoJo					
EA	Hands Free Dispenser, Black 1200 ml, Pro Link #GJ-YB120 or approved equal	25	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -	\$8.32	\$ 208.00	\$6.35	\$ 158.75	no bid	\$ -	Free	\$ -	\$21.80	\$ 545.00	\$22.16	\$ 554.00	\$33.11	\$ 827.75	\$29.82	\$ 745.50	\$49.99	\$ 1,249.75		
									Stoko							Provon					GoJo		GoJo					
CS	All Purpose Cleaner, Pine Sol Lavender Scented, (144 oz bottle) CLO 97301 Or approved equal 3 bottles/case	80	\$29.51	\$ 2,360.80	\$35.98	\$ 2,878.40	\$46.80	\$ 3,744.00	\$13.26	\$ 1,060.80	\$28.83	\$ 2,306.40	\$42.85	\$ 3,428.00	\$26.70	\$ 2,136.00	\$28.70	\$ 2,296.00	\$28.10	\$ 2,248.00	\$30.23	\$ 2,418.40	\$43.82	\$ 3,505.60	\$39.99	\$ 3,199.20		
									GP Forward		Wepak					Dial					Clorox							
CS	Wood Polish, Orange Clean Pledge #72373 (9.7 oz. bottle) Or approved equal 12/back	40	no bid	\$ -	59.98	\$ 2,399.20	33.65	\$ 1,346.00	35.95	\$ 1,438.00	\$17.42	\$ 696.80	no bid	\$ -	\$60.99	\$ 2,439.60	\$49.30	\$ 1,972.00	\$55.41	\$ 2,216.40	\$53.00	\$ 2,120.00	\$63.37	\$ 2,534.80	\$83.88	\$ 3,355.20		
									Pledge 95763074 6/13.8 oz		Simoniz					CSI Pro												
CS	Disinfectant Sprav, Pro-Link #CM-RA008 (15.5 oz. bottle) Or approved equal 12/case	50	\$35.95	\$ 1,797.50	27.98	\$ 1,399.00	\$36.92	\$ 1,846.00	\$25.47	\$ 1,273.50	\$26.28	\$ 1,314.00	\$49.62	\$ 2,481.00	\$34.59	\$ 1,729.50	\$36.30	\$ 1,815.00	\$57.97	\$ 2,898.50	\$62.60	\$ 3,130.00	\$91.99	\$ 4,599.50	\$59.99	\$ 2,999.50		
									Chase #5157 12/16.5 oz		Chase 433-4104 12/16.5 oz		12/15.5 oz			Spring Grove		CSI Pro			Reliable		Champion		Misty Amra			
CS	Floor Neutralizer, Spray Buff Snapback, Diversey 4116 (1 gallon bottle) Or approved equal 4 gallons/case	9	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -	\$73.65	\$ 662.85	\$26.92	\$ 242.28	\$45.37	\$ 408.33	\$26.93	\$ 242.37	\$107.00	\$ 963.00	\$92.00	\$ 828.00	\$31.20	\$ 280.80	\$100.14	\$ 901.26	\$44.77	\$ 402.93	\$199.99	\$ 1,799.91		
											Simoniz		Aero		Revitalize						Quantum Leap							
CS	Wax Floor Finish, Diversey Vectra#04078 (1 gallon bottle) Or approved equal 4 gallons/case	9	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -	\$74.80	\$ 673.20	\$41.00	\$ 369.00	\$52.54	\$ 472.86	\$57.12	\$ 514.08	\$96.82	\$ 871.38	\$74.50	\$ 670.50	\$48.00	\$ 432.00	\$80.46	\$ 724.14	\$56.17	\$ 505.53	\$69.99	\$ 629.91		
											Simoniz		Aero		Superior Plus			Floor Science			Super Shine							
CS	Floor Stripper, Neutral Scent, Diversey Floor Science #880437 (1 gallon bottle) Or approved equal 4 gallons/case	11	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -	\$45.60	\$ 501.60	\$27.18	\$ 298.98	\$42.18	\$ 463.98	\$40.84	\$ 449.24	\$60.82	\$ 669.02	\$49.00	\$ 539.00	\$45.99	\$ 505.89	\$70.18	\$ 771.98	\$47.61	\$ 523.71	\$69.99	\$ 769.89		
											Diversey Bravo		Simoniz		Aero		No Scrub Plus				Floor Science							
CS	Bleach, germicidal Pure Bright #KIK BLEACH6 (1 gallon bottle) Or approved equal 6 bottles/case	70	no bid	\$ -	no bid	\$ -	\$9.85	\$ 689.50	\$8.47	\$ 592.90	\$10.30	\$ 721.00	\$11.45	\$ 801.50	\$8.82	\$ 617.40	\$11.00	\$ 770.00	\$11.55	\$ 808.50	\$12.30	\$ 861.00	\$37.36	\$ 2,615.20	\$19.99	\$ 1,399.30		
	Percentage Discount Allowed			0%		25%		30%		12%		0%		0%		39%		10%-min 30%-max		0%		40%		5%		2%		
	TOTAL BID AMOUNT			\$ 4,158.30		\$ 6,676.60		\$ 9,463.15		\$ 10,421.76		\$ 10,866.62		\$ 13,338.09		\$ 13,885.25		\$ 16,178.00		\$ 16,426.19		\$ 19,158.88		\$ 24,683.17		\$ 26,251.11		
				Non-responsive No samples provided		Non-responsive No samples provided		Non-responsive No samples provided						Non-responsive No samples provided				Non-responsive No samples provided		Non-responsive No samples provided		Non-responsive No samples provided		Non-responsive No samples provided		Non-responsive No samples provided		