

BID TABULATION
Personal Protective Equipment
IFB#18009-AG

			Homestead Materials Handling		Incredible Supply LLC		OBBCO Safety		Saf-T-Glove Inc.		Gemplers		Airgas	
<u>CATEGORY NO. 1 - Hard Hats</u>			<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>
<u>Quantity</u>														
50	ea	Hard Hats – Standard, Type II, Class G/ E, Color: Yellow	\$27.96	\$1,398.00	\$5.71	\$285.50	\$5.45	\$272.50	\$28.60	\$1,430.00	\$27.00	\$1,350.00	\$36.79	\$1,839.50
25	ea	Hard Hats – Full Brim, Type II, Class G/ E, Color: White or Yellow	\$45.03	\$1,125.75	\$8.03	\$200.75	\$13.30	\$332.50	\$46.05	\$1,151.25	\$14.00	\$350.00	\$38.92	\$973.00
25	ea	Hard Hats-Cap Style, Type I, Class G/E, Blue	\$4.87	\$121.75	\$5.71	\$142.75	\$5.45	\$136.25	\$5.25	\$131.25	\$8.00	\$200.00	\$7.36	\$184.00
10	ea	Headgear bracket – Type II, Class G/ E, Crews 102 (or approved equal)	\$5.42	\$54.20	\$4.44	\$44.40	\$4.72	\$47.20	\$5.15	\$51.50	\$6.39	\$63.90	\$4.82	\$48.20
10	ea	Face Shield (short) – to fit above brackets 8154LB (or approved equal)	\$1.72	\$17.20	\$1.44	\$14.40	\$0.98	\$9.80	\$1.05	\$10.50	\$1.92	\$19.20	\$2.93	\$29.30
10	ea	Face Shield (long) – to fit above brackets HG410-A4 (or approved equal)	\$1.91	\$19.10	\$7.63	\$76.30	\$2.67	\$26.70	\$5.25	\$52.50	NO BID	\$0.00	\$5.69	\$56.90
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY 1				\$2,736.00		\$764.10		\$824.95		\$2,827.00		\$1,983.10		\$3,130.90
<u>CATEGORY NO. 2 – Rain suits, Chaps, Overalls, shoe covers</u>			<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>
25	ea	Rain Suit – Coat and Pant, basic yellow 2003 River City (or approved equal) (sizes M-XL)	\$7.46	\$186.50	\$5.98	\$149.50	\$5.89	\$147.25	\$6.59	\$164.75	\$9.80	\$245.00	\$6.02	\$150.50
1	ea	(sizes 2X-3X)	\$8.12	\$8.12	\$6.37	\$6.37	\$6.13	\$6.13	\$6.99	\$6.99	\$9.80	\$9.80	\$6.27	\$6.27
1	ea	(sizes 4X-5X)	\$9.08	\$9.08	\$7.01	\$7.01	\$6.65	\$6.65	\$7.45	\$7.45	\$9.80	\$9.80	\$6.80	\$6.80
25	ea	Rain Suit – Class III PVC, Coated Polyester set 2 PC w/ reflective stripping (sizes M-XL)	\$43.77	\$1,094.25	\$35.00	\$875.00	\$34.45	\$861.25	\$38.60	\$965.00	\$74.24	\$1,856.00	\$199.88	\$4,997.00
1	ea	(sizes 2X-3X)	\$47.80	\$47.80	\$37.42	\$37.42	\$36.05	\$36.05	\$42.15	\$42.15	\$79.19	\$79.19	\$219.88	\$219.88
1	ea	(sizes 4X-5X)	\$49.95	\$49.95	\$39.83	\$39.83	\$39.20	\$39.20	\$43.95	\$43.95	\$79.19	\$79.19	\$259.86	\$259.86
25	ea	Rain Jacket-ClassIII, Dickie J6200 or approved equal (sizes M-XL)	NO BID	\$0.00	\$28.89	\$722.25	\$29.00	\$725.00	\$42.75	\$1,068.75	\$49.79	\$1,244.75	\$32.47	\$811.75
1	ea	(sizes 2X-3X)	NO BID	\$0.00	\$28.89	\$28.89	\$29.00	\$29.00	\$47.10	\$47.10	\$53.11	\$53.11	\$32.47	\$32.47
1	ea	(sizes 4X-5X)	NO BID	\$0.00	\$28.89	\$28.89	\$29.00	\$29.00	\$51.50	\$51.50	\$53.11	\$53.11	\$32.47	\$32.47
5	ea	Chaps – Class A protective, 6 ply, manufacturer: Stihl or approved equal (34")	\$120.40	\$602.00	\$48.61	\$243.05	\$44.60	\$223.00	\$72.75	\$363.75	NO BID	\$0.00	\$99.59	\$497.95
5	ea	(38")	\$120.40	\$602.00	\$48.61	\$243.05	\$44.60	\$223.00	\$74.25	\$371.25	NO BID	\$0.00	\$101.88	\$509.40
5	ea	(42")	\$120.40	\$602.00	\$48.61	\$243.05	\$44.60	\$223.00	\$74.25	\$371.25	NO BID	\$0.00	\$104.24	\$521.20
10	cs	Coveralls – Tyvex, disposable, open cuff, open ankles, white, TY120S or approved equal (sizes M-XL)	\$105.45	\$1,054.50	\$48.01	\$480.10	\$36.00	\$360.00	\$101.25	\$1,012.50	\$108.32	\$1,083.20	\$93.75	\$937.50
1	ea	(sizes 2X-3X)	\$118.47	\$118.47	\$1.97	\$4.23	\$36.00	\$36.00	\$4.50	\$4.50	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$3.98	\$3.98
1	ea	(sizes 4X-5X)	\$138.16	\$138.16	\$2.21	\$2.21	\$36.00	\$36.00	\$5.45	\$5.45	\$140.00	\$140.00	\$4.55	\$4.55
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY 2				\$4,512.83		\$3,110.85		\$2,980.53		\$4,526.34		\$4,973.15		\$8,991.58
<u>CATEGORY NO. 3 – Safety Glasses, Ear Plugs</u>			<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>
25	ea	Safety Glasses – Black frame, Clear lens - Crews 18105 (or approved equal)	NO BID	\$0.00	\$1.79	\$44.75	\$1.15	\$28.75	\$2.60	\$65.00	\$2.27	\$56.75	\$1.41	\$35.25
25	ea	Safety Glass – Wrap around safety glasses, ANSI Z87.1 rated, UVEX Astro OTG-3001 (or approved equal)	\$6.86	\$171.50	\$1.14	\$28.50	\$2.16	\$54.00	\$3.75	\$93.75	\$7.30	\$182.50	\$6.36	\$159.00
25	ea	Safety Glasses –Smoke tinted lens, Radians #RSI-20 (or approved equal)	\$1.74	\$43.58	\$1.06	\$26.50	\$1.25	\$31.25	\$1.50	\$37.50	\$2.37	\$59.25	\$1.27	\$31.75
25	ea	Safety Glasses –Impact goggles	\$1.06	\$26.50	\$8.94	\$223.50	\$0.95	\$23.75	\$1.25	\$31.25	\$9.70	\$242.50	\$4.56	\$114.00
25	ea	Ear Muff – Swivel style QM24, NRR=25, Howard Leight, (or approved equal)	\$6.12	\$153.00	\$5.66	\$141.50	\$5.20	\$130.00	\$6.50	\$162.50	\$5.60	\$140.00	\$5.33	\$133.25
5	bx	Ear Plugs – Corded, disposable, NRR=29, 3M1100 (or approved equal) (200/bx)	\$14.02	\$70.10	\$23.55	\$117.75	\$21.00	\$105.00	\$22.95	\$114.75	\$20.30	\$101.50	\$40.00	\$200.00
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY 3				\$464.68		\$582.50		\$372.75		\$504.75		\$782.50		\$673.25

BID TABULATION
Personal Protective Equipment
IFB#18009-AG

			Homestead Materials Handling		Incredible Supply LLC		OBBCO Safety		Saf-T-Glove Inc.		Gemplers		Airgas	
<u>CATEGORY NO. 4 – Gloves</u>			<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>
10	dz	Gloves – Leather palm, 'C' grade, safety cuff, Memphis 1200 or Memphis 1400 (or approved equal) sizes (L to XXL)	\$21.30	\$213.00	\$20.40	\$204.00	\$19.60	\$196.00	\$22.56	\$225.60	\$2.74	\$27.40	\$20.76	\$207.60
10	dz	Gloves – Economy grade, foam nitrile, black, G-Tek, PIP 34-C232 (or approved equal) (L-XL)	\$12.63	\$126.30	\$14.67	\$146.70	\$11.00	\$110.00	\$12.60	\$126.00	\$12.20	\$122.00	\$11.04	\$110.40
100	pk	Gloves – Latex, disposable, powder free, SCI/MCR Safety 6015 series (or approved equal) (100/pk) L-XL	\$4.11	\$411.00	\$5.83	\$583.00	\$4.00	\$400.00	\$6.75	\$675.00	\$8.50	\$850.00	\$64.24	\$6,424.00
10	cs	Gloves – Nitrile coated, G-Tek Maxiflex 34-874 or approved equal EN388: 4131; Abrasion 4, Cut 1, Tear 3, Puncture 1 12 dozen/cs (L-XL)	\$35.20	\$352.00	\$286.37	\$2,863.70	\$396.00	\$3,960.00	\$439.20	\$4,392.00	\$14.98	\$149.80	\$397.44	\$3,974.40
10	cs	Gloves-thermo grip, hi-vis orange acrylic terry shell, brown micro finish, latex grip, 10 gauge, thermal insulation, ISO certified EN388: 1231, Abrasion 1, Cut 2, Tear 3, Puncture 1; PIP 41-1400 or approved equal; 6 dozen/case; (S-XXL)	\$33.25	\$332.50	\$179.98	\$1,799.80	\$290.00	\$2,900.00	\$317.52	\$3,175.20	\$8.00	\$80.00	\$290.16	\$2,901.60
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY 4				\$1,434.80	\$5,597.20	\$7,566.00	\$8,593.80	\$1,229.20	\$13,618.00					
<u>CATEGORY NO. 5 – Other Personal Protective Equipment</u>			<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>
50	pr	Knee Pads-Foam cushion or gel filled, hook and loop closure, Part# OCC125W (or approved equal)	\$11.56	\$578.00	\$8.86	\$443.00	\$8.25	\$412.50	\$8.15	\$407.50	NO BID	\$0.00	\$7.35	\$367.50
20	bx	Dust Mask-Nuisance, disposable, light dust mask #RPDM1 (or approved equal) (50/box)	NO BID	\$0.00	\$4.54	\$90.80	\$2.85	\$57.00	\$3.50	\$70.00	\$5.37	\$107.40	\$4.65	\$93.00
20	pr	Waders-Roll Down Hip Waders, Black PVC, Steel Toe Steel Toe exceeds ASTM 2413-05 M 1/75/C/75 Ongard (or approved equal) sizes 8-15	\$64.63	\$1,292.60	\$80.55	\$1,611.00	\$43.20	\$864.00	\$70.38	\$1,407.60	\$58.76	\$1,175.20	\$54.31	\$1,086.20
10	pr	Chest waders-rubber, insulated, waterproof, steel toe protection, trac tread, meets ASTM F2413-11 M 1/75 C/75 PR EH; color: Forest Green, Ranger A2071 or approved equal	\$109.29	\$1,092.90	\$109.11	\$1,091.10	\$85.95	\$859.50	\$102.40	\$1,024.00	\$100.00	\$1,000.00	\$85.29	\$852.90
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY 5				\$2,963.50	\$3,235.90	\$2,193.00	\$2,909.10	\$2,282.60	\$2,399.60					
TOTAL CATEGORIES 1 through 5				\$12,111.81	\$13,290.55	\$13,937.23	\$19,360.99	\$11,250.55	\$28,813.33					
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT				20%	20%	20%	15%	25%	10%					