
Police Uniforms

IFB#19002-AG

Group 1 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY FOOTWEAR Mfg./Item

Male and Female

SIZES - 4 TO 14

EACH

50 Duty Boot, 6 inch 5.11 #12311 101.98$                  5,099.00$                 

100 Duty Boot, 8 inch 5.11 #12312 117.88$                  11,788.00$               

100 Dress Oxford, High Gloss Bates #E33252 & E22741 71.49$                    7,149.00$                 

50 Dispatcher Oxford Law Pro #S89610 34.50$                    1,725.00$                 

SUBTOTAL $ 25,761.00$               

Group 2 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY SHIRTS AND BLOUSES Mfg./Item

Male and Female

L/S=LONG SLEEVE -- S/S=SHORT SLEEVE

EACH

100 Police Class A L/S, Navy, Female Fechheimer #142R78Z 86 47.95$                    4,795.00$                 

100 Police Class A S/S, Navy, Female Fechheimer #192R78Z 86 44.95$                    4,495.00$                 

200 Police Class A L/S, Navy, Male Fechheimer #42W78Z 86 47.95$                    9,590.00$                 

200 Police Class A S/S, Navy, Male Fechheimer #92W78Z 86 44.95$                    8,990.00$                 

10 Animal Control Class A L/S, Green, Female Fechheimer #126R78Z 01 47.95$                    479.50$                    

10 Animal Control Class A S/S, Green, Female Fechheimer #33W78Z 01 44.95$                    449.50$                    

10 Animal Control Class A S/S, Green, Male Fechheimer #176R78 01 47.95$                    479.50$                    

10 Animal Control Class A S/S, Green, Male Fechheimer #85R78Z 01 44.95$                    449.50$                    

15 Class A L/S, Light Blue (Parking) Southeastern #3202 37.57$                    563.55$                    

15 Class A S/S, Light Blue (Parking) Southeastern #3202 35.41$                    531.15$                    

50 Dispatch L/S, Polo Elbeco #K5144 & #K5184LC 50.07$                    2,503.50$                 

50 Dispatch S/S, Polo Elbeco #K5134 & #K5174LC 40.87$                    2,043.50$                 

25 Command L/S, Dress White Fechheimer #42W78Z & 142R78Z 86 47.95$                    1,198.75$                 

20 Class B, Utility L/S Shirt, Female Fechheimer #FX5100W 47.95$                    959.00$                    

20 Class B, Utility S/S Shirt, Female Fechheimer #FX5100 47.95$                    959.00$                    

40 Class B, Utility L/S Shirt, Male Fechheimer #FX5120W 44.95$                    1,798.00$                 

40 Class B, Utility S/S Shirt, Male Fechheimer #FX5120 44.95$                    1,798.00$                 

200 Polo, L/S Elbeco #K5144 & K5184LC 50.07$                    10,014.00$               

200 Polo, S/S Elbeco #K5134 & K5174LC 40.87$                    8,174.00$                 

40 Large Police Panel for Polo Shirt Premier Emblem #E807 5.00$                      200.00$                    

10 Flying Wheel Motorcycle Patch Hero's Pride #8206 3.00$                      30.00$                      

10 Cloth Diver Insignia for Dive Team Shirt Vanguard #2122220 3.50$                      35.00$                      

10 Tactical Rapid Assault Shirt 5.11 #72194 50.28$                    502.80$                    

19 Two Pocket BDU Shirt Propper #F545238001 27.54$                    523.26$                    

20 Recruit L/S Shirt, Khaki Dickies #574 20.32$                    406.40$                    

60 Recruit S/S Shirt, Khaki Dickies #1574 22.93$                    1,375.80$                 

400 Standard Department Patch Hero's Pride #G22850B 1.45$                      580.00$                    

30 Service Stripes Premier Emblem 2.00$                      60.00$                      

120 Cloth Badges Premier Emblem #A16158-11WOFC 1.45$                      174.00$                    

& A16158-14YWLT

SUBTOTAL $ 64,157.71$               

Group 3 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY SWEATERS Mfg./Item

Male and Female

L/S=LONG SLEEVE 

EACH

10 Dispatch Sweater, Button Front, with Reinforced Elbows A+ Apparel #6300 50.59$                    505.90$                    

SUBTOTAL $ 505.90$                    

Group 4 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY TROUSERS AND PANTS Mfg./Item

EACH Male and Female

75 Police Class A with Custom Stripe, Female Galls 47.95$                    3,596.25$                 

200 Police Class A with Custom Stripe, Male Galls 47.95$                    9,590.00$                 

6 Motorcycle Class A with Custom Stripe & Features Galls 150.00$                  900.00$                    

20 Animal Control, Class A, Female Fechheimer #3900W 10 38.33$                    766.60$                    

10 Animal Control, Class A, Male Fechheimer #3900 10 38.33$                    383.30$                    

15 Class B, Utility, Female Fechheimer #FX57300W 44.95$                    674.25$                    

20 Class B, Utility, Male Fechheimer #FX57300 44.95$                    899.00$                    

10 Barrier Pants Mocean #2054 75.05$                    750.50$                    

10 Bike/Marine/Dive Shorts Mocean #1020 61.10$                    611.00$                    

10 Dispatch, Navy, Female Tru-Spec #1193 40.00$                    400.00$                    

10 Dispatch, Navy, Male Tru-Spec #1185 40.00$                    400.00$                    

12 Parking, Navy Fechheimer #FX57400 48.21$                    578.52$                    

10

EMT Utility Pants w/Reflective Tape on Rear & Side 

Pockets Galls #TR359 33.00$                    330.00$                    

10 Tactical Style Pant with Flex Tac 5.11 #74369 63.10$                    631.00$                    

60 Recruit Pants, Khaki Dickies #874 22.93$                    1,375.80$                 

25 High Visibility Green Pants Spiewak #S305V 82.35$                    2,058.75$                 

10 BDU Uniform Trousers Propper #F525014 23.97$                    239.70$                    

SUBTOTAL $ 24,184.67$               

Galls LLC



Police Uniforms

IFB#19002-AG

Galls LLC

Group 5 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY ACCESSORIES Mfg./Item

EACH

50 Clip On Neck Ties, Post Office Blue Sam Broome #900 4.38$                      219.00$                    

10 Clip on Neck Ties, Black Sam Broome #900 4.38$                      43.80$                      

50 Mock Turtle Necks Cobmex #1101 8.18$                      409.00$                    

30 Campaign Straw Hat w/Eye, Gray Stratton #S-40DB 79.74$                    2,392.20$                 

6 Campaign Straw Hat w/Eye, AC Green Stratton #S-40DB 79.74$                    478.44$                    

25 Campaign Hat Rain Cover (per box) Keystone #129 6.03$                      150.75$                    

40 Hat Strap W. Alboum Hat #ST-3P 7.00$                      280.00$                    

40 Hat Cord Stratton #SR-CD 8.00$                      320.00$                    

25 VA Hat Seal Blackinton #CE-3 14.74$                    368.50$                    

30 Stocking Cap, Black, with "SPD" embroidered Heritage Sportwear #1501C 9.95$                      298.50$                    

10 Baseball Style Cap, Navy Blue Galls #HW434 18.40$                    184.00$                    

SUBTOTAL $ 5,144.19$                 

Group 6 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY COATS and JACKETS Mfg./Item

EACH

25 Shield Duty Jacket, Navy Blue Elbeco #56100A 191.63$                  4,790.75$                 

25 Shield Performance Softshell Jacket, Navy Blue Elbeco #56400A 101.69$                  2,542.25$                 

6 Shield Duty Jacket, Black Elbeco #56100A 191.63$                  1,149.78$                 

6 Shield Performance Softshell Jacket, Black Elbeco #56100A 101.69$                  610.14$                    

10 Command Staff/Honor Guard Dress Coat Hope Coat #JX842 387.60$                  3,876.00$                 

15 Waterproof Code B Bike Jacket Mocean #5051AC 244.97$                  3,674.55$                 

25 Rain Suit Spiewak #S305V 109.45$                  2,736.25$                 

10 Men's Thermal Lined Duck Active Jacket Carhartt #J131 Size S-2X, 3X+ & Tall $58.71 53.56$                    535.60$                    

10 Hi Visibility ANSI Class III Waterproof Parka Reflective Apparel #VEA-431 99.99$                    999.90$                    

SUBTOTAL $ 20,915.22$               

Group 7 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY DUTY GEAR Mfg./Item

EACH

50 Hi Gloss Mag Pouch Gould & Goodrich #H627 33.73$                    1,686.50$                 

50 Hi Gloss OC Pouch Gould & Goodrich #H631 19.00$                    950.00$                    

50 Hi Gloss Cuff Case Gould & Goodrich #H70CL 22.48$                    1,124.00$                 

75 Leather Duty Belt, High Gloss with Silver Buckle Gould & Goodrich #H59 51.10$                    3,832.50$                 

40 Leather Waist Belt with Silve Buckle Duty Man #1611 Size: 46-52 $18.78 54 & up $20.96 16.00$                    640

25 Nylon Duty Belt Blackhawk #44B2 29.51$                    737.75$                    

25 Nylon Waist Belt Blackhawk #44B1 16.00$                    400.00$                    

Duty Holster

50      o   6280-83-91 RH No Bid -$                        -$                          

50      o   6280-83-92 LH No Bid -$                        -$                          

Duty Holster

50      o   6280-283-91 RH No Bid -$                        -$                          

50      o   6280-283-91 LH No Bid -$                        -$                          

10 Insdie Trouser Holster Gould & Goodrich #B890 22.00$                    220.00$                    

50 Nylon OC Pouch Gould & Goodrich #X681-3 14.00$                    700.00$                    

50 Nylon Cuff Case Gould & Goodrich #X70 17.25$                    862.50$                    

Nylon Duty Holster

50      o   6280-83-131 RH No Bid -$                        -$                          

50      o   6280-83-132 LH No Bid -$                        -$                          

10 Tactical Leg Holster No Bid -$                        -$                          

10 Holster for Guns w/M3 Light No Bid -$                        -$                          

Serpa CQC Holster

50      o   410500BK-R RH Blackhawk #410500BK-R RH 29.50$                    1,475.00$                 

50      o   410500BK-L LH Blackhawk #410500BK-L LH 29.50$                    1,475.00$                 

Serpa CQC Holster

50      o   410502BK-R RH Blackhawk #410502BK-R RH 29.50$                    1,475.00$                 

50      o   410502BK-L LH Blackhawk #410502BK-L LH 29.50$                    1,475.00$                 

50 Nylon Keepers (4 pack) No Bid -$                        -$                          

50 Leather Belt Keepers with Snaps Gould & Goodrich #B76 11.00$                    550.00$                    

50 Universal Radio Case (Nylon Use) Uncle Mike's #88806 30.66$                    1,533.00$                 

50 Nylon Light Holder No Bid -$                        -$                          

50 Elite Stinger XT Light Holder No Bid -$                        -$                          

50 Nylon Glove Pouch Uncle Mike's #89072 9.20$                      460.00$                    

50 K Force Glove Pouch Gould & Goodrich #K555 16.00$                    800.00$                    

10 Detective Double Mag Pouch, Black Leather Gould & Goodrich #H627 33.73$                    337.30$                    

10 Detective OC/Cuff Pouch, Black Leather Aker #A619 50.99$                    509.90$                    

SUBTOTAL $ 21,243.45$               



Police Uniforms

IFB#19002-AG

Galls LLC

Group 8 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY SWAT UNIFORM Mfg./Item

EACH

10 United Shield Spec Ops Delta-Gen IIIA Helmet United Shield #SPECOPS DLTA 735.00$                  7,350.00$                 

10 Tactical Backpack Galls #BG847 30.00$                    300.00$                    

10 Tactical FR Glove Fechheimer #VTX6010 51.00$                    510.00$                    

10 Riot Control Suit Damascus #FX1 MPDEPT 350.00$                  3,500.00$                 

10 Riot Duty Helmet with Steel Grid Premier Crown #JCR100C 166.30$                  1,663.00$                 

10 Riot Control Gloves Damascus #CRT100 36.00$                    360.00$                    

10 Riot Shield 36" x 20" Paulson #BS-2 98.00$                    980.00$                    

10 NOMEX Lightweight Hood Damascus #NH50L 11.50$                    115.00$                    

10 Gas Mask Pouch Galls #GSMKPC 16.50$                    165.00$                    

-$                          

SUBTOTAL $ 14,943.00$               

Group 9 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY BALLESTIC VESTS Mfg./Item

EACH

50 Black Body Armour Level IIIA Vest Point Blank #HL6ABDV0M 855.00$                  42,750.00$               

20 Vest Carrier, Replacement Point Blank #HL6N00BV0M 78.75$                    1,575.00$                 

50 Tactical Outer Carrier w/Police  CSI Panels Point Blank #OS1N00BVJ0J 183.96$                  9,198.00$                 

SUBTOTAL $ 53,523.00$               

Group 10 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY AWARDS, BADGES, PINS, ETC… Mfg./Item

EACH

25 Badges with Pin, Black Lettering Blackinton 60.89$                    1,522.25$                 

25 Badges, Flat for Wallet with Clip, Black Lettering Blackinton 60.89$                    1,522.25$                 

25 Large Collar Device Blackinton J Series 6.89$                      172.25$                    

25 Small Collar Device Blackinton J Series 6.89$                      172.25$                    

50 Name Bar, Black Lettering Blackinton J5 12.78$                    639.00$                    

20 Name Bar, Attachment, Single Blackinton J7 12.78$                    255.60$                    

20 Name Bar, Attachment, Double Blackinton J8 12.78$                    255.60$                    

10 Motorcycle Pin Blackinton #3740 7.66$                      76.60$                      

10 Fatality Investigator Pin Blackinton #A2143 13.64$                    136.40$                    

10 Diver Pin Vanguard #2168250 4.00$                      40.00$                      

10 SWAT Pin Blackinton #A7512 10.79$                    107.90$                    

25 Cab Sliders (Awards) Blackinton #A4616-A 14.00$                    350.00$                    

10 Cab Slider Holder, Single Blackinton #SB1A 3.75$                      37.50$                      

25 Cab Slider Holder, Double Blackinton #SB2A 6.09$                      152.25$                    

25 Cab Slider Holder, Triple Blackinton #SB3A 6.95$                      173.75$                    

25 Cab Slider Holder, 4 Bar Blackinton #SB4A 11.95$                    298.75$                    

25 Cab Slider Holder, 5 Bar Blackinton #SB5A 12.81$                    320.25$                    

SUBTOTAL $ 6,232.60$                 

Group 11 Bidder Proposed Specification

QTY ALTERATIONS/EMBROIDERY Mfg./Item

EACH

25 Add Cloth Badge 1.50$                      37.50$                      

100 Add Chevrons 1.50$                      150.00$                    

50 Add Service Stripes 1.50$                      75.00$                      

50 Add/Create Name Tags 2.00$                      100.00$                    

10 Add Zippers to Female Class A Shirts 5.00$                      50.00$                      

100 Adjust Trouser Hem 5.00$                      500.00$                    

50 Adjust Sleeve Length 5.00$                      250.00$                    

100 Embroidery for Shirts 7.00$                      700.00$                    

20 Embroidery for Ball Caps 12.00$                    240.00$                    

SUBTOTAL $ 2,102.50$                 

BID TOTAL

(INCLUDES GROUPS 1-11) $_____________________ 238,713.24$             


