

BID TABULATION

Safety Supplies 21014-JA
September 15, 2020
All bids are subject to review by the Purchasing Office and using Departments

| | | Chris Safety Supplies | | OBBCO Safety | | Pyramid School Products | | Capital Electric | | Guarney Inc | | Kipper Tool Company | | Equipment Works | | Top Safety Products | |
|---------------------------------------------|----|-----------------------|-------------|--------------|-------------|-------------------------|-------------|------------------|-------------|-------------|-------------|---------------------|------------|-----------------|-------------|---------------------|------------|
| Quantity | | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total |
| CATEGORY NO. 1 - Cones & Barrels | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 600 | ea | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | \$22.50 | \$13,500.00 | \$16.20 | \$9,720.00 | \$19.98 | \$11,988.00 | \$20.15 | \$12,090.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$19.79 | \$11,874.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 100 | ea | \$37.50 | \$3,750.00 | \$58.65 | \$5,865.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | \$78.00 | \$7,800.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$41.15 | \$4,115.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 100 | ea | \$8.00 | \$800.00 | \$5.75 | \$575.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | \$20.65 | \$2,065.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$25.95 | \$2,595.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| | | | \$18,050.00 | | \$16,160.00 | | \$11,988.00 | | \$21,755.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$18,584.00 | | \$0.00 |
| CATEGORY NO. 2 - Batteries | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 25 | cs | \$51.40 | \$1,285.00 | \$26.40 | \$660.00 | \$32.28 | \$807.00 | \$3.41 | \$1,023.00 | \$13.40 | \$4,020.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$47.70 | \$1,192.50 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 5 | cs | \$196.40 | \$982.00 | \$90.00 | \$450.00 | \$64.08 | \$320.40 | \$2.26 | \$813.60 | \$24.35 | \$730.50 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$107.48 | \$519.44 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 15 | cs | \$62.50 | \$937.50 | \$43.20 | \$648.00 | \$37.44 | \$561.60 | \$1.19 | \$1,285.20 | \$8.04 | \$1,447.20 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$73.48 | \$1,024.34 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 5 | cs | \$94.85 | \$474.25 | \$51.70 | \$258.50 | \$51.84 | \$259.20 | \$1.55 | \$558.00 | \$11.98 | \$359.40 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$53.48 | \$249.44 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 20 | cs | \$59.52 | \$1,190.40 | \$26.00 | \$520.00 | \$23.04 | \$460.80 | \$0.60 | \$1,152.00 | \$8.54 | \$683.20 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$45.99 | \$919.80 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 25 | cs | \$47.04 | \$1,176.00 | \$26.00 | \$650.00 | \$23.04 | \$576.00 | \$0.82 | \$1,488.00 | \$9.01 | \$801.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$47.08 | \$1,069.24 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| | | | \$6,045.15 | | \$3,196.90 | | \$2,985.60 | | \$6,319.80 | | \$8,141.38 | | \$0.00 | | \$4,974.76 | | \$0.00 |
| CATEGORY NO. 3 - Fire Extinguishers | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 35 | ea | \$55.95 | \$1,958.25 | \$19.75 | \$691.25 | no bid | \$0.00 | \$34.55 | \$1,209.25 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$51.75 | \$1,811.25 | \$35.00 | \$1,225.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 85 | ea | \$72.50 | \$6,162.50 | \$35.00 | \$2,975.00 | no bid | \$0.00 | \$78.00 | \$6,630.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$58.95 | \$5,010.75 | \$66.00 | \$4,760.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 2 | ea | \$223.99 | \$447.98 | \$89.95 | \$179.90 | | | \$120.00 | \$240.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$224.00 | \$448.00 | \$115.00 | \$230.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| | | | \$8,568.73 | | \$3,846.15 | | \$0.00 | | \$8,079.25 | | \$0.00 | | \$7,279.00 | | \$6,215.00 | | \$0.00 |
| CATEGORY NO. 4 - First Aid Kits | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 10 | ea | \$68.12 | \$681.20 | \$30.00 | \$300.00 | no bid | \$0.00 | \$38.25 | \$382.50 | \$4.05 | \$40.50 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$53.39 | \$533.90 | \$25.50 | \$255.00 |
| 200 | ea | \$28.00 | \$5,600.00 | \$10.80 | \$2,160.00 | no bid | \$0.00 | \$24.00 | \$4,800.00 | \$16.45 | \$3,290.00 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$26.33 | \$5,266.00 | \$23.76 | \$4,752.00 |
| | | | \$6,281.20 | | \$2,460.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$5,182.50 | | \$3,730.50 | | \$0.00 | | \$6,799.90 | | \$5,007.00 |
| TOTAL CATEGORIES 1 through 4 | | | \$38,945.08 | | \$26,652.65 | | \$14,973.00 | | \$41,336.65 | | \$11,871.80 | | \$7,270.00 | | \$35,573.66 | | \$5,007.00 |
| PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT | | | 5% | | 5% | | 15% | | 10% | | 10% | | 0% | | 3% | | 0% |